

**Humboldt County Office of Education
2019-2020 Cooperative Paper Bid Analysis**

Alternative	Bidder	Revised Score **	Initial % of Bid Completed	Action	NOTES
1	Contract Paper Group	404.67	64%		Lowest score, but did not bid on 90% of the items and is disqualified
	Mendes Supply Company	480.92	61%		Highest score and did not bid on 90% of the items and is disqualified
	West Coast Paper Solutions	448.36	99%	Award	Second lowest score and bid on 90% of the listed items.
2	Contract Paper Group	398.24	76%		Second lowest score, but did not bid on 90% of the items and is disqualified
	Mendes Supply Company	406.86	55%		Highest score and did not bid on 90% of the items and is disqualified
	West Coast Paper Solutions	385.22	95%	Award	Lowest score and bid on 90% of listed items
3	West Coast Paper Solutions	637.94	95%	Award	There was only one qualifying bid for Alternative III from WCP Solutions

**Revised with lowest bids for non-bids and removed unavailable items by 2 or more vendors

**COOPERATIVE PAPER BID FOR 2020-2021
HUMBOLDT COUNTY OFFICE OF EDUCATION**

ALTERNATIVE ONE 10,000 LBS OR MORE, ONE DELIVERY PER DESTINATION

DESCRIPTION	SCORE	VALUE	UNIT	BID ONE	BID TWO	BID THREE	SCORE ONE	SCORE TWO	SCORE THREE
XEROGRAPHIC, SULPHITE 8 1/2 X 11, SUB 20									
WHITE	137.38	92.83%	RMS	2.535	3.05	2.85	348.26	419.02	391.54
YELLOW	0.15	0.10%	RMS	4.275	5.18	4.95	0.64	0.78	0.74
BLUE	0.15	0.10%	RMS	4.275	5.18	4.95	0.64	0.78	0.74
GREEN	0.15	0.10%	RMS	4.275	5.18	4.95	0.64	0.78	0.74
PINK	0.15	0.10%	RMS	4.275	5.18	4.95	0.64	0.78	0.74
GOLD	0.15	0.10%	RMS	4.275	5.18	4.95	0.64	0.78	0.74
BUFF	0.15	0.10%	RMS	4.275	5.18	4.95	0.64	0.78	0.74
SALMON	0.15	0.10%	RMS	4.275	5.18	4.95	0.64	0.78	0.74
CHERRY	0.15	0.10%	RMS	4.275	5.18	4.95	0.64	0.78	0.74
TAN	0.15	0.10%	RMS	4.275	5.18	4.95	0.64	0.78	0.74
IVORY	0.15	0.10%	RMS	4.275	5.18	4.95	0.64	0.78	0.74
GRAY	0.15	0.10%	RMS	4.275	5.18	4.95	0.64	0.78	0.74
CREAM WHITE	0.15	0.10%	RMS	NO BID	5.18	4.95	0.00	0.78	0.74
ORCHID	0.15	0.10%	RMS	4.275	5.18	4.95	0.64	0.78	0.74

**XEROGRAPHIC
8 1/2 X 14, SUB 20**

WHITE	1.00	0.68%	RMS	4.15	4.24	4.02	4.15	4.24	4.02
SALMON	0.08	0.05%	RMS	NO BID	NO BID	6.08	0.00	0.00	0.49
IVORY	0.08	0.05%	RMS	5.79	7.20	6.08	0.46	0.58	0.49
BUFF	0.08	0.05%	RMS	NO BID	NO BID	6.08	0.00	0.00	0.49
GREEN	0.08	0.05%	RMS	5.79	7.20	6.08	0.46	0.58	0.49
GOLD	0.08	0.05%	RMS	5.79	7.20	6.08	0.46	0.58	0.49
BLUE	0.08	0.05%	RMS	5.79	7.20	6.08	0.46	0.58	0.49
PINK	0.08	0.05%	RMS	5.79	7.20	6.08	0.46	0.58	0.49
YELLOW	0.08	0.05%	RMS	5.79	7.20	6.08	0.46	0.58	0.49
TAN	0.08	0.05%	RMS	NO BID	NO BID	6.08	0.00	0.00	0.49

**XEROGRAPHIC
11 X 17, SUB 20**

WHITE	0.05	0.03%	RMS	6.67	7.19	6.70	0.33	0.36	0.34
-------	------	-------	-----	------	------	------	------	------	------

**RECYCLED XEROGRAPHIC
8 1/2 X 11, SUB 20**

WHITE	0.05	0.03%	RMS	3.46	3.39	3.49	0.17	0.17	0.17
-------	------	-------	-----	------	------	------	------	------	------

**100% RECYCLED XEROGRAPHIC
11x17, SUB 20**

WHITE	0.05	0.03%	RMS	8.91	8.10	8.95	0.45	0.41	0.45
-------	------	-------	-----	------	------	------	------	------	------

**HUSKY
8 1/2 X 11, SUB 60**

WHITE	0.05	0.03%	RMS	NO BID	5.12	4.95	0.00	0.26	0.25
-------	------	-------	-----	--------	------	------	------	------	------

**Revised with lowest bids for non-bids
and removed unavailable items by 2 or more vendors

BID ONE**	BID TWO**	BID THREE**	SCORE ONE**	SCORE TWO**	SCORE THREE**
2.535	3.05	2.85	348.26	419.02	391.54
4.275	5.18	4.95	0.64	0.78	0.74
4.275	5.18	4.95	0.64	0.78	0.74
4.275	5.18	4.95	0.64	0.78	0.74
4.275	5.18	4.95	0.64	0.78	0.74
4.275	5.18	4.95	0.64	0.78	0.74
4.275	5.18	4.95	0.64	0.78	0.74
4.275	5.18	4.95	0.64	0.78	0.74
4.275	5.18	4.95	0.64	0.78	0.74
4.275	5.18	4.95	0.64	0.78	0.74
4.275	5.18	4.95	0.64	0.78	0.74
4.275	5.18	4.95	0.64	0.78	0.74
4.950	5.18	4.95	0.74	0.78	0.74
4.275	5.18	4.95	0.64	0.78	0.74

4.15	4.24	4.02	4.15	4.24	4.02
5.79	7.20	6.08	0.46	0.58	0.49
5.79	7.20	6.08	0.46	0.58	0.49
5.79	7.20	6.08	0.46	0.58	0.49
5.79	7.20	6.08	0.46	0.58	0.49
5.79	7.20	6.08	0.46	0.58	0.49
5.79	7.20	6.08	0.46	0.58	0.49
5.79	7.20	6.08	0.46	0.58	0.49

6.67	7.19	6.70	0.33	0.36	0.34
------	------	------	------	------	------

3.46	3.39	3.49	0.17	0.17	0.17
------	------	------	------	------	------

8.91	8.10	8.95	0.45	0.41	0.45
------	------	------	------	------	------

4.95	5.12	4.95	0.25	0.26	0.25
------	------	------	------	------	------

**COOPERATIVE PAPER BID FOR 2020-2021
HUMBOLDT COUNTY OFFICE OF EDUCATION**

ALTERNATIVE ONE

10,000 LBS OR MORE, ONE DELIVERY PER DESTINATION

DESCRIPTION	SCORE	VALUE	UNIT	BID ONE	BID TWO	BID THREE	SCORE ONE	SCORE TWO	SCORE THREE
-------------	-------	-------	------	---------	---------	-----------	-----------	-----------	-------------

**HUSKY
11 X 17, SUB 60**

WHITE	0.05	0.03%	RMS	NO BID	11.27	10.50	0.00	0.56	0.53
-------	------	-------	-----	--------	-------	-------	------	------	------

**HUSKY
8 1/2 X 11, SUB 70**

WHITE	0.05	0.03%	RMS	NO BID	6.07	5.90	0.00	0.30	0.30
-------	------	-------	-----	--------	------	------	------	------	------

**HUSKY
11 X 17, SUB 70**

WHITE	0.05	0.03%	RMS	NO BID	12.42	12.00	0.00	0.62	0.60
-------	------	-------	-----	--------	-------	-------	------	------	------

**COUGAR
8 1/2 X 11, SUB 80, COVER**

WHITE	0.05	0.03%	RMS	NO BID	7.65	8.50	0.00	0.38	0.43
-------	------	-------	-----	--------	------	------	------	------	------

**COUGAR
8 1/2 X 11, SUB 70, TEXT**

WHITE	0.05	0.03%	RMS	NO BID	5.92	7.55	0.00	0.30	0.38
-------	------	-------	-----	--------	------	------	------	------	------

**TAG
11 x 17, SUB 100**

BRIGHT WHITE	0.20	0.14%	RMS	NO BID	NO BID	12.92	0.00	0.00	2.58
--------------	------	-------	-----	--------	--------	-------	------	------	------

**TAG
11 x 17, SUB 125**

BRIGHT WHITE	0.20	0.14%	RMS	NO BID	NO BID	15.06	0.00	0.00	3.01
--------------	------	-------	-----	--------	--------	-------	------	------	------

CARBONLESS PRE-COLLATED REVERSE SEQUENCE

8 1/2 X 11

2-PART	0.29	0.19%	RMS	NO BID	10.96	11.65	0.00	3.15	3.35
3-PART	0.29	0.20%	RMS	NO BID	12.04	13.14	0.00	3.49	3.81
4-PART	0.29	0.20%	RMS	NO BID	13.23	13.25	0.00	3.84	3.84
5-PART	0.19	0.13%	RMS	NO BID	13.57	13.65	0.00	2.58	2.59

CARBONLESS PRE-COLLATED STRAIGHT SEQUENCE

8 1/2 X 11

2-PART	0.28	0.19%	RMS	NO BID	NO BID	11.65	0.00	0.00	3.26
3-PART	0.28	0.19%	RMS	NO BID	12.04	13.14	0.00	3.37	3.68
4-PART	0.28	0.19%	RMS	NO BID	13.23	13.25	0.00	3.70	3.71
5-PART	0.18	0.12%	RMS	NO BID	13.57	13.65	0.00	2.44	2.46

ENVELOPES, STD FLAP, WHITE 24#

A-2	0.01	0.01%	1,000	NO BID	35.48	28.80	0.00	0.35	0.29
A-6	0.01	0.01%	1,000	NO BID	41.00	34.85	0.00	0.41	0.35
NO. 6-1/4 REMIT	0.01	0.01%	1,000	NO BID	38.98	30.00	0.00	0.39	0.30
NO. 9 REGULAR	0.01	0.01%	1,000	NO BID	18.98	20.15	0.00	0.19	0.20
NO. 10 REGULAR	0.01	0.01%	1,000	NO BID	19.15	20.10	0.00	0.19	0.20
NO. 10 WINDOW	0.01	0.01%	1,000	NO BID	26.28	22.50	0.00	0.26	0.23

****Revised with lowest bids for non-bids
and removed unavailable items by 2 or more vendors**

BID ONE**	BID TWO**	BID THREE**	SCORE ONE**	SCORE TWO**	SCORE THREE**
-----------	-----------	-------------	-------------	-------------	---------------

10.50	11.27	10.50	0.53	0.56	0.53
-------	-------	-------	------	------	------

5.90	6.07	5.90	0.30	0.30	0.30
------	------	------	------	------	------

12.00	12.42	12.00	0.60	0.62	0.60
-------	-------	-------	------	------	------

7.65	7.65	8.50	0.38	0.38	0.43
------	------	------	------	------	------

5.92	5.92	7.55	0.30	0.30	0.38
------	------	------	------	------	------

--	--	--	--	--	--

--	--	--	--	--	--

10.96	10.96	11.65	3.15	3.15	3.35
12.04	12.04	13.14	3.49	3.49	3.81
13.23	13.23	13.25	3.84	3.84	3.84
13.57	13.57	13.65	2.58	2.58	2.59

12.04	12.04	13.14	3.37	3.37	3.68
13.23	13.23	13.25	3.70	3.70	3.71
13.57	13.57	13.65	2.44	2.44	2.46

28.80	35.48	28.80	0.29	0.35	0.29
34.85	41.00	34.85	0.35	0.41	0.35
30.00	38.98	30.00	0.30	0.39	0.30
18.98	18.98	20.15	0.19	0.19	0.20
19.15	19.15	20.10	0.19	0.19	0.20
22.50	26.28	22.50	0.23	0.26	0.23

**COOPERATIVE PAPER BID FOR 2020-2021
HUMBOLDT COUNTY OFFICE OF EDUCATION**

ALTERNATIVE ONE 10,000 LBS OR MORE, ONE DELIVERY PER DESTINATION

DESCRIPTION	SCORE	VALUE	UNIT	BID ONE	BID TWO	BID THREE	SCORE ONE	SCORE TWO	SCORE THREE
ENVELOPES, DIGITAL FLAP, WHITE WOVE 24#									
NO. 10 WINDOW	0.01	0.01%	1,000	NO BID	29.01	27.40	0.00	0.29	0.27

**ASTROBRITES
8 1/2 X 11, 60# BOOK**

LIFT-OFF LEMON	0.01	0.01%	RMS	7.90	NO BID	7.50	0.08	0.00	0.08
SOLAR YELLOW	0.01	0.01%	RMS	7.90	9.49	7.50	0.08	0.09	0.08
SUNBURST YELLOW	0.01	0.01%	RMS	7.90	9.49	7.50	0.08	0.09	0.08
RE-ENTRY RED	0.01	0.01%	RMS	7.90	9.49	7.50	0.08	0.09	0.08
PLASMA PINK	0.01	0.01%	RMS	7.90	NO BID	7.50	0.08	0.00	0.08
PULSAR PINK	0.01	0.01%	RMS	7.90	9.49	7.50	0.08	0.09	0.08
FIREBALL FUCHSIA	0.01	0.01%	RMS	7.90	NO BID	7.50	0.08	0.00	0.08
BLAST-OFF BLUE	0.01	0.01%	RMS	9.85	NO BID	7.50	0.10	0.00	0.08
CELESTIAL BLUE	0.01	0.01%	RMS	7.90	NO BID	7.50	0.08	0.00	0.08
LUNAR BLUE	0.01	0.01%	RMS	7.90	9.49	7.50	0.08	0.09	0.08
TERRESTRIAL TEAL	0.01	0.01%	RMS	7.90	NO BID	7.50	0.08	0.00	0.08
ECLIPSE BLACK	0.01	0.01%	RMS	13.10	NO BID	7.50	0.13	0.00	0.08
GALAXY GOLD	0.01	0.01%	RMS	7.90	NO BID	7.50	0.08	0.00	0.08
COSMIC ORANGE	0.01	0.01%	RMS	7.90	NO BID	7.50	0.08	0.00	0.08
ORBIT ORANGE	0.01	0.01%	RMS	7.90	9.49	7.50	0.08	0.09	0.08
ROCKET RED	0.01	0.01%	RMS	7.90	NO BID	7.50	0.08	0.00	0.08
OUTRAGEOUS ORCHID	0.01	0.01%	RMS	7.90	NO BID	7.50	0.08	0.00	0.08
PLANETARY PURPLE	0.01	0.01%	RMS	7.90	9.49	7.50	0.08	0.09	0.08
GRAVITY GRAPE	0.01	0.01%	RMS	7.90	NO BID	7.50	0.08	0.00	0.08
VENUS VIOLET	0.01	0.01%	RMS	7.90	NO BID	7.50	0.08	0.00	0.08
VULCAN GREEN	0.01	0.01%	RMS	7.90	9.49	7.50	0.08	0.09	0.08
TERRA GREEN	0.01	0.01%	RMS	7.90	9.49	7.50	0.08	0.09	0.08
MARTIAN GREEN	0.01	0.01%	RMS	7.90	NO BID	7.50	0.08	0.00	0.08
GAMMA GREEN	0.01	0.01%	RMS	7.90	9.49	7.50	0.08	0.09	0.08

**ASTROBRITES
8 1/2 X 11, 65# COVER**

LIFT-OFF LEMON	0.01	0.01%	PKG	7.88	NO BID	6.65	0.08	0.00	0.07
SOLAR YELLOW	0.01	0.01%	PKG	7.88	9.49	6.65	0.08	0.09	0.07
SUNBURST YELLOW	0.01	0.01%	PKG	7.88	9.49	6.65	0.08	0.09	0.07
RE-ENTRY RED	0.01	0.01%	PKG	7.88	9.49	6.65	0.08	0.09	0.07
PLASMA PINK	0.01	0.01%	PKG	7.88	NO BID	6.65	0.08	0.00	0.07
PULSAR PINK	0.01	0.01%	PKG	7.88	9.49	6.65	0.08	0.09	0.07
FIREBALL FUCHSIA	0.01	0.01%	PKG	7.88	NO BID	6.65	0.08	0.00	0.07
BLAST-OFF BLUE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	10.25	NO BID	6.65	0.10	0.00	0.07
CELESTIAL BLUE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	7.88	NO BID	6.65	0.08	0.00	0.07
LUNAR BLUE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	7.88	9.49	6.65	0.08	0.09	0.07
TERRESTRIAL TEAL	0.01	0.01%	PKG	7.88	NO BID	6.65	0.08	0.00	0.07
ECLIPSE BLACK	0.01	0.01%	PKG	13.75	NO BID	NO BID	0.14	0.00	0.00
GALAXY GOLD	0.01	0.01%	PKG	7.88	NO BID	6.65	0.08	0.00	0.07
COSMIC ORANGE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	7.88	NO BID	6.65	0.08	0.00	0.07
ORBIT ORANGE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	7.88	9.49	6.65	0.08	0.09	0.07
ROCKET RED	0.01	0.01%	PKG	7.88	NO BID	6.65	0.08	0.00	0.07
OUTRAGEOUS ORCHID	0.01	0.01%	PKG	7.88	NO BID	6.65	0.08	0.00	0.07
PLANETARY PURPLE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	7.88	9.49	6.65	0.08	0.09	0.07
GRAVITY GRAPE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	7.88	NO BID	6.65	0.08	0.00	0.07
VENUS VIOLET	0.01	0.01%	PKG	7.88	NO BID	6.65	0.08	0.00	0.07
VULCAN GREEN	0.01	0.01%	PKG	7.88	9.49	6.65	0.08	0.09	0.07
TERRA GREEN	0.01	0.01%	PKG	7.88	9.49	6.65	0.08	0.09	0.07
MARTIAN GREEN	0.01	0.01%	PKG	7.88	NO BID	6.65	0.08	0.00	0.07
GAMMA GREEN	0.01	0.01%	PKG	7.88	9.49	6.65	0.08	0.09	0.07

**ASTROBRITES
11x17, 65# COVER**

LIFT-OFF LEMON	0.01	0.01%	PKG	16.00	NO BID	14.36	0.16	0.00	0.14
SOLAR YELLOW	0.01	0.01%	PKG	16.00	NO BID	14.36	0.16	0.00	0.14
SUNBURST YELLOW	0.01	0.01%	PKG	16.00	NO BID	14.36	0.16	0.00	0.14
RE-ENTRY RED	0.01	0.01%	PKG	16.00	NO BID	14.36	0.16	0.00	0.14

****Revised with lowest bids for non-bids
and removed unavailable items by 2 or more vendors**

BID ONE**	BID TWO**	BID THREE**	SCORE ONE**	SCORE TWO**	SCORE THREE**
27.40	29.01	27.40	0.27	0.29	0.27

7.90	7.50	7.50	0.08	0.08	0.08
7.90	9.49	7.50	0.08	0.09	0.08
7.90	9.49	7.50	0.08	0.09	0.08
7.90	9.49	7.50	0.08	0.09	0.08
7.90	7.50	7.50	0.08	0.08	0.08
7.90	9.49	7.50	0.08	0.09	0.08
7.90	7.50	7.50	0.08	0.08	0.08
7.90	9.49	7.50	0.08	0.09	0.08
7.90	7.50	7.50	0.10	0.08	0.08
7.90	7.50	7.50	0.08	0.08	0.08
7.90	9.49	7.50	0.08	0.09	0.08
7.90	7.50	7.50	0.08	0.08	0.08
7.90	9.49	7.50	0.08	0.09	0.08
7.90	7.50	7.50	0.13	0.08	0.08
7.90	7.50	7.50	0.08	0.08	0.08
7.90	7.50	7.50	0.08	0.08	0.08
7.90	9.49	7.50	0.08	0.09	0.08
7.90	7.50	7.50	0.08	0.08	0.08
7.90	9.49	7.50	0.08	0.09	0.08
7.90	7.50	7.50	0.08	0.08	0.08
7.90	9.49	7.50	0.08	0.09	0.08
7.90	7.50	7.50	0.08	0.08	0.08
7.90	9.49	7.50	0.08	0.09	0.08
7.90	7.50	7.50	0.08	0.08	0.08
7.90	9.49	7.50	0.08	0.09	0.08

7.88	6.65	6.65	0.08	0.07	0.07
7.88	9.49	6.65	0.08	0.09	0.07
7.88	9.49	6.65	0.08	0.09	0.07
7.88	9.49	6.65	0.08	0.09	0.07
7.88	6.65	6.65	0.08	0.07	0.07
7.88	9.49	6.65	0.08	0.09	0.07
7.88	6.65	6.65	0.08	0.07	0.07
10.25	6.65	6.65	0.10	0.07	0.07
7.88	6.65	6.65	0.08	0.07	0.07
7.88	9.49	6.65	0.08	0.09	0.07
7.88	6.65	6.65	0.08	0.07	0.07
7.88	6.65	6.65	0.08	0.07	0.07
7.88	6.65	6.65	0.08	0.07	0.07
7.88	9.49	6.65	0.08	0.09	0.07
7.88	9.49	6.65	0.08	0.09	0.07
7.88	6.65	6.65	0.08	0.07	0.07
7.88	6.65	6.65	0.08	0.07	0.07
7.88	9.49	6.65	0.08	0.09	0.07
7.88	9.49	6.65	0.08	0.09	0.07
7.88	6.65	6.65	0.08	0.07	0.07
7.88	9.49	6.65	0.08	0.09	0.07

16.00	14.36	14.36	0.16	0.14	0.14
16.00	14.36	14.36	0.16	0.14	0.14
16.00	14.36	14.36	0.16	0.14	0.14
16.00	14.36	14.36	0.16	0.14	0.14

**COOPERATIVE PAPER BID FOR 2020-2021
HUMBOLDT COUNTY OFFICE OF EDUCATION**

ALTERNATIVE ONE 10,000 LBS OR MORE, ONE DELIVERY PER DESTINATION

DESCRIPTION	SCORE	VALUE	UNIT	BID ONE	BID TWO	BID THREE	SCORE ONE	SCORE TWO	SCORE THREE
PULSAR PINK	0.01	0.01%	PKG	16.00	NO BID	14.36	0.16	0.00	0.14
FIREBALL FUCHSIA	0.01	0.01%	PKG	16.00	NO BID	14.36	0.16	0.00	0.14
CELESTIAL BLUE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	16.00	NO BID	14.36	0.16	0.00	0.14
LUNAR BLUE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	16.00	NO BID	14.36	0.16	0.00	0.14
ECLIPSE BLACK	0.01	0.01%	PKG	28.00	NO BID	NO BID	0.28	0.00	0.00
GALAXY GOLD	0.01	0.01%	PKG	16.00	NO BID	14.36	0.16	0.00	0.14
COSMIC ORANGE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	16.00	NO BID	14.36	0.16	0.00	0.14
ORBIT ORANGE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	16.00	NO BID	14.36	0.16	0.00	0.14
ROCKET RED	0.01	0.01%	PKG	16.00	NO BID	14.36	0.16	0.00	0.14
PLANETARY PURPLE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	16.00	NO BID	14.36	0.16	0.00	0.14
VULCAN GREEN	0.01	0.01%	PKG	16.00	NO BID	14.36	0.16	0.00	0.14
TERRA GREEN	0.01	0.01%	PKG	16.00	NO BID	14.36	0.16	0.00	0.14
MARTIAN GREEN	0.01	0.01%	PKG	16.00	NO BID	14.36	0.16	0.00	0.14
GAMMA GREEN	0.01	0.01%	PKG	16.00	NO BID	14.36	0.16	0.00	0.14

****Revised with lowest bids for non-bids and removed unavailable items by 2 or more vendors**

BID ONE**	BID TWO**	BID THREE**	SCORE ONE**	SCORE TWO**	SCORE THREE**
16.00	14.36	14.36	0.16	0.14	0.14
16.00	14.36	14.36	0.16	0.14	0.14
16.00	14.36	14.36	0.16	0.14	0.14
16.00	14.36	14.36	0.16	0.14	0.14
16.00	14.36	14.36	0.16	0.14	0.14
16.00	14.36	14.36	0.16	0.14	0.14
16.00	14.36	14.36	0.16	0.14	0.14
16.00	14.36	14.36	0.16	0.14	0.14
16.00	14.36	14.36	0.16	0.14	0.14
16.00	14.36	14.36	0.16	0.14	0.14
16.00	14.36	14.36	0.16	0.14	0.14
16.00	14.36	14.36	0.16	0.14	0.14
16.00	14.36	14.36	0.16	0.14	0.14
16.00	14.36	14.36	0.16	0.14	0.14
16.00	14.36	14.36	0.16	0.14	0.14
16.00	14.36	14.36	0.16	0.14	0.14

**INDEX, SUB 90
8 1/2 X 11, 250 SHEETS PER PKG**

WHITE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	6.19	6.01	5.75	0.06	0.06	0.06
-------	------	-------	-----	------	------	------	------	------	------

6.19	6.01	5.75	0.06	0.06	0.06
------	------	------	------	------	------

**INDEX, SUB 90
11 X 17, 250 SHEETS PER PKG**

WHITE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	13.00	12.58	11.46	0.13	0.13	0.11
-------	------	-------	-----	-------	-------	-------	------	------	------

13.00	12.58	11.46	0.13	0.13	0.11
-------	-------	-------	------	------	------

**INDEX, SUB 90
12 X 18, 250 SHEETS PER PKG**

WHITE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	NO BID	NO BID	15.00	0.00	0.00	0.15
-------	------	-------	-----	--------	--------	-------	------	------	------

--	--	--	--	--	--

**INDEX, SUB 90
13X19, 250 SHEETS PER PKG**

WHITE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	NO BID	NO BID	22.50	0.00	0.00	0.23
-------	------	-------	-----	--------	--------	-------	------	------	------

--	--	--	--	--	--

**DIGITAL COATED - DULL COVER, SUB 80
12 x 18, 800 SHEETS PER CARTON**

WHITE	0.01	0.01%	CARTON	NO BID	14.85	24.50	0.00	0.15	0.25
-------	------	-------	--------	--------	-------	-------	------	------	------

14.85	14.85	24.50	0.15	0.15	0.25
-------	-------	-------	------	------	------

**DIGITAL COATED - DULL COVER, SUB 100
12 x 18, 700 SHEETS PER CARTON**

WHITE	0.01	0.01%	CARTON	NO BID	19.38	30.00	0.00	0.19	0.30
-------	------	-------	--------	--------	-------	-------	------	------	------

19.38	19.38	30.00	0.19	0.19	0.30
-------	-------	-------	------	------	------

**COOPERATIVE PAPER BID FOR 2020-2021
HUMBOLDT COUNTY OFFICE OF EDUCATION**

ALTERNATIVE ONE

10,000 LBS OR MORE, ONE DELIVERY PER DESTINATION

****Revised weith lowest bids for non-bids
and removed unavailable items by 2 or more vendors**

DESCRIPTION	SCORE	VALUE	UNIT	BID ONE	BID TWO	BID THREE	SCORE ONE	SCORE TWO	SCORE THREE
-------------	-------	-------	------	---------	---------	-----------	-----------	-----------	-------------

BID ONE**	BID TWO**	BID THREE**	SCORE ONE**	SCORE TWO**	SCORE THREE**
-----------	-----------	-------------	-------------	-------------	---------------

**DIGITAL COATED - GLOSS COVER, SUB 80
12 x 18, 800 SHEETS PER CARTON**

WHITE	0.01	0.01%	CARTON	NO BID	14.85	24.50	0.00	0.15	0.25
-------	------	-------	--------	--------	-------	-------	------	------	------

14.85	14.85	24.50	0.15	0.15	0.25
-------	-------	-------	------	------	------

**DIGITAL COATED - GLOSS COVER, SUB 100
12 x 18, 700 SHEETS PER CARTON**

WHITE	0.01	0.01%	CARTON	NO BID	19.38	30.15	0.00	0.19	0.30
-------	------	-------	--------	--------	-------	-------	------	------	------

19.38	19.38	30.15	0.19	0.19	0.30
-------	-------	-------	------	------	------

**DIGITAL COATED - DULL COVER, SUB 80
11 x 17, 750 SHEETS PER CARTON**

WHITE	0.01	0.01%	CARTON	NO BID	48.58	21.80	0.00	0.49	0.22
-------	------	-------	--------	--------	-------	-------	------	------	------

21.80	48.58	21.80	0.22	0.49	0.22
-------	-------	-------	------	------	------

**DIGITAL COATED - DULL COVER, SUB 100
11 x 17, 750 SHEETS PER CARTON**

WHITE	0.01	0.01%	CARTON	NO BID	41.40	26.50	0.00	0.41	0.27
-------	------	-------	--------	--------	-------	-------	------	------	------

26.50	41.40	26.50	0.27	0.41	0.27
-------	-------	-------	------	------	------

**DIGITAL COATED - GLOSS COVER, SUB 80
11 x 17, 750 SHEETS PER CARTON**

WHITE	0.01	0.01%	CARTON	NO BID	48.58	21.10	0.00	0.49	0.21
-------	------	-------	--------	--------	-------	-------	------	------	------

21.10	48.58	21.10	0.21	0.49	0.21
-------	-------	-------	------	------	------

**DIGITAL COATED - GLOSS COVER, SUB 100
11 x 17, 750 SHEETS PER CARTON**

WHITE	0.01	0.01%	CARTON	NO BID	32.83	27.10	0.00	0.33	0.27
-------	------	-------	--------	--------	-------	-------	------	------	------

27.10	32.83	27.10	0.27	0.33	0.27
-------	-------	-------	------	------	------

**DIGITAL COATED - GLOSS TEXT SUB 80
11 x 17, 1000 SHEETS PER PKG**

WHITE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	NO BID	13.90	32.44	0.00	0.14	0.32
-------	------	-------	-----	--------	-------	-------	------	------	------

13.90	13.90	32.44	0.14	0.14	0.32
-------	-------	-------	------	------	------

**DIGITAL COATED - GLOSS TEXT SUB 80
8 1/2 x 11, 1000 SHEETS PER PKG**

WHITE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	NO BID	71.85	15.90	0.00	0.72	0.16
-------	------	-------	-----	--------	-------	-------	------	------	------

15.90	71.85	15.90	0.16	0.72	0.16
-------	-------	-------	------	------	------

**DIGITAL COATED - GLOSS TEXT SUB 100
11x17, 1000 SHEETS PER PKG**

WHITE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	NO BID	67.34	27.20	0.00	0.67	0.27
-------	------	-------	-----	--------	-------	-------	------	------	------

27.70	67.34	27.20	0.28	0.67	0.27
-------	-------	-------	------	------	------

**DIGITAL COATED - GLOSS TEXT SUB 100
12x18, 1000 SHEETS PER PKG**

WHITE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	NO BID	14.85	31.40	0.00	0.15	0.31
-------	------	-------	-----	--------	-------	-------	------	------	------

14.85	14.85	31.40	0.15	0.15	0.31
-------	-------	-------	------	------	------

**DIGITAL COATED - GLOSS TEXT SUB 100
8 1/2 x 11, 1000 SHEETS PER PKG**

WHITE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	NO BID	19.38	10.30	0.00	0.19	0.10
-------	------	-------	-----	--------	-------	-------	------	------	------

10.30	19.38	10.30	0.10	0.19	0.10
-------	-------	-------	------	------	------

**DIGITAL COATED - DULL COVER, SUB 80
12 x 18, 500 SHEETS PER CARTON**

WHITE	0.01	0.01%	CARTON	NO BID	14.85	23.20	0.00	0.15	0.23
-------	------	-------	--------	--------	-------	-------	------	------	------

14.85	14.85	23.20	0.15	0.15	0.23
-------	-------	-------	------	------	------

**DIGITAL COATED - DULL COVER, SUB 100
12 x 18, 500 SHEETS PER CARTON**

WHITE	0.01	0.01%	CARTON	NO BID	19.38	30.00	0.00	0.19	0.30
-------	------	-------	--------	--------	-------	-------	------	------	------

19.38	19.38	30.00	0.19	0.19	0.30
-------	-------	-------	------	------	------

**DIGITAL COATED - GLOSS COVER, SUB 80
12 x 18, 500 SHEETS PER CARTON**

WHITE	0.01	0.01%	CARTON	NO BID	48.58	23.20	0.00	0.49	0.23
-------	------	-------	--------	--------	-------	-------	------	------	------

23.20	48.58	23.20	0.23	0.49	0.23
-------	-------	-------	------	------	------

**COOPERATIVE PAPER BID FOR 2020-2021
HUMBOLDT COUNTY OFFICE OF EDUCATION**

ALTERNATIVE ONE

10,000 LBS OR MORE, ONE DELIVERY PER DESTINATION

DESCRIPTION	SCORE	VALUE	UNIT	BID ONE	BID TWO	BID THREE	SCORE ONE	SCORE TWO	SCORE THREE
-------------	-------	-------	------	---------	---------	-----------	-----------	-----------	-------------

**DIGITAL COATED - GLOSS COVER, SUB 100
12 x 18, 500 SHEETS PER CARTON**

WHITE	0.01	0.01%	CARTON	NO BID	41.40	30.00	0.00	0.41	0.30
-------	------	-------	--------	--------	-------	-------	------	------	------

**DIGITAL COATED - DULL COVER, SUB 80
11 x 17, 500 SHEETS PER CARTON**

WHITE	0.01	0.01%	CARTON	NO BID	48.58	21.80	0.00	0.49	0.22
-------	------	-------	--------	--------	-------	-------	------	------	------

**DIGITAL COATED - DULL COVER, SUB 100
11 x 17, 500 SHEETS PER CARTON**

WHITE	0.01	0.01%	CARTON	NO BID	32.81	26.10	0.00	0.33	0.26
-------	------	-------	--------	--------	-------	-------	------	------	------

**DIGITAL COATED - GLOSS COVER, SUB 80
11 x 17, 500 SHEETS PER CARTON**

WHITE	0.01	0.01%	CARTON	NO BID	49.09	21.10	0.00	0.49	0.21
-------	------	-------	--------	--------	-------	-------	------	------	------

**DIGITAL COATED - GLOSS COVER, SUB 100
11 x 17, 500 SHEETS PER CARTON**

WHITE	0.01	0.01%	CARTON	NO BID	40.80	27.10	0.00	0.41	0.27
-------	------	-------	--------	--------	-------	-------	------	------	------

**DIGITAL COATED - GLOSS TEXT SUB 80
11 x 17, 1000 SHEETS PER PKG**

WHITE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	NO BID	41.71	32.44	0.00	0.42	0.32
-------	------	-------	-----	--------	-------	-------	------	------	------

24# PREMIUM MATTE INKJET ROLL PAPER

24" X 150' 2" OR 3" CORE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	NO BID	NO BID	80.80	0.00	0.00	0.81
--------------------------	------	-------	-----	--------	--------	-------	------	------	------

PREMIUM MATTE PHOTO ROLL PAPER

24" X 100' 3" CORE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	NO BID	NO BID	39.48	0.00	0.00	0.39
--------------------	------	-------	-----	--------	--------	-------	------	------	------

ECONOMY MATTE IMAGING ROLL PAPER

24" X 100' 3" CORE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	NO BID	NO BID	39.48	0.00	0.00	0.39
--------------------	------	-------	-----	--------	--------	-------	------	------	------

Other Scoring Metrics - Yes=0 or No=1

Bid Prices Continue through 06/30/2020?	1.00	0.68%	N/A	0.00	1.00	0.00	0.00	1.00	0.00
Weekly delivery a-la-carte available at bid price?	1.00	0.68%	N/A	1.00	1.00	0.00	1.00	1.00	0.00
Option for bulk printing of envelopes	1.00	0.68%	N/A	1.00	0.00	0.00	1.00	0.00	0.00

TOTAL	148.00	100.00%	148		Initial Score	372.97	476.56	460.65	
					Line Items Bid	94.00	91.00	146.00	
					% of Bid Completed	64%	61%	99%	

****Revised with lowest bids for non-bids
and removed unavailable items by 2 or more vendors**

BID ONE**	BID TWO**	BID THREE**	SCORE ONE**	SCORE TWO**	SCORE THREE**
-----------	-----------	-------------	-------------	-------------	---------------

30.00	41.40	30.00	0.30	0.41	0.30
-------	-------	-------	------	------	------

21.80	48.58	21.80	0.22	0.49	0.22
-------	-------	-------	------	------	------

26.10	32.81	26.10	0.26	0.33	0.26
-------	-------	-------	------	------	------

21.10	49.09	21.10	0.21	0.49	0.21
-------	-------	-------	------	------	------

27.10	40.80	27.10	0.27	0.41	0.27
-------	-------	-------	------	------	------

32.44	41.71	32.44	0.32	0.42	0.32
-------	-------	-------	------	------	------

--	--	--	--	--	--

--	--	--	--	--	--

--	--	--	--	--	--

0.00	1.00	0.00	0.00	1.00	0.00
1.00	1.00	0.00	1.00	1.00	0.00
1.00	0.00	0.00	1.00	0.00	0.00

	Final Score	404.67	480.92	448.36	
135.00	Total Items	135.00	135.00	135.00	
	% of Bid Completed	100%	100%	100%	

NOTES

Bid One = Contract Paper Group
Bid Two = Mendes Supply Company
Bid Three = West Coast Paper Company

Lowest score, but did not bid on 90% of the items and is disqualified
Highest score and did not bid on 90% of the items and is disqualified
Second lowest score and bid on 90% of the listed items.

**COOPERATIVE PAPER BID FOR 2020-2021
HUMBOLDT COUNTY OFFICE OF EDUCATION**

ALTERNATIVE TWO LESS THAN 10,000 LBS, ONE DELIVERY PER DESTINATION

DESCRIPTION	SCORE	VALUE	UNIT	BID ONE	BID TWO	BID THREE	SCORE ONE	SCORE TWO	SCORE TWO
XEROGRAPHIC, SULPHITE	8 1/2 X 11, SUB 20								
WHITE	118.28	93.13%	RMS	2.98	3.05	2.89	352.47	360.75	341.83
YELLOW	0.15	0.12%	RMS	4.75	5.18	4.95	0.71	0.78	0.74
BLUE	0.15	0.12%	RMS	4.75	5.18	4.95	0.71	0.78	0.74
GREEN	0.15	0.12%	RMS	4.75	5.18	4.95	0.71	0.78	0.74
PINK	0.15	0.12%	RMS	4.75	5.18	4.95	0.71	0.78	0.74
GOLD	0.15	0.12%	RMS	4.75	5.18	4.95	0.71	0.78	0.74
BUFF	0.15	0.12%	RMS	4.75	5.18	4.95	0.71	0.78	0.74
SALMON	0.15	0.12%	RMS	4.75	5.18	4.95	0.71	0.78	0.74
CHERRY	0.15	0.12%	RMS	4.75	5.18	4.95	0.71	0.78	0.74
TAN	0.15	0.12%	RMS	4.75	5.18	4.95	0.71	0.78	0.74
IVORY	0.15	0.12%	RMS	4.75	5.18	4.95	0.71	0.78	0.74
GRAY	0.15	0.12%	RMS	4.75	5.18	4.95	0.71	0.78	0.74
CREAM WHITE	0.15	0.12%	RMS	4.75	5.18	4.95	0.71	0.78	0.74
ORCHID	0.15	0.12%	RMS	4.75	5.18	4.95	0.71	0.78	0.74
XEROGRAPHIC	8 1/2 X 14, SUB 20								
WHITE	1.00	0.79%	RMS	4.15	4.24	4.02	4.15	4.24	4.02
SALMON	0.08	0.60%	RMS	NO BID	NO BID	6.08	0.00	0.00	0.49
IVORY	0.08	0.60%	RMS	6.16	7.20	6.08	0.49	0.58	0.49
BUFF	0.08	0.60%	RMS	NO BID	NO BID	6.08	0.00	0.00	0.49
GREEN	0.08	0.60%	RMS	6.16	7.20	6.08	0.49	0.58	0.49
GOLD	0.08	0.60%	RMS	6.16	7.20	6.08	0.49	0.58	0.49
BLUE	0.08	0.60%	RMS	6.16	7.20	6.08	0.49	0.58	0.49
PINK	0.08	0.60%	RMS	6.16	7.20	6.08	0.49	0.58	0.49
YELLOW	0.08	0.60%	RMS	6.16	7.20	6.08	0.49	0.58	0.49
TAN	0.08	0.60%	RMS	NO BID	NO BID	6.08	0.00	0.00	0.49
XEROGRAPHIC	11 X 17, SUB 20								
WHITE	0.05	0.04%	RMS	7.58	7.19	6.70	0.38	0.36	0.34
RECYCLED XEROGRAPHIC	8 1/2 X 11, SUB 20								
WHITE	0.05	0.04%	RMS	3.89	3.39	3.49	0.19	0.17	0.17
100% RECYCLED XEROGRAPHIC	11x17, SUB 20								
WHITE	0.05	0.04%	RMS	9.88	8.10	8.95	0.49	0.41	0.45
HUSKY	8 1/2 X 11, SUB 60								
WHITE	0.05	0.04%	RMS	NO BID	5.12	4.95	0.00	0.26	0.25
HUSKY	11 X 17, SUB 60								
WHITE	0.05	0.04%	RMS	NO BID	11.27	10.50	0.00	0.56	0.53
HUSKY	8 1/2 X 11, SUB 70								
WHITE	0.05	0.04%	RMS	NO BID	6.07	5.90	0.00	0.30	0.30
HUSKY	11 X 17, SUB 70								
WHITE	0.05	0.04%	RMS	NO BID	12.42	12.00	0.00	0.62	0.60
COUGAR	8 1/2 X 11, SUB 80, COVER								
WHITE	0.05	0.04%	RMS	NO BID	7.65	8.05	0.00	0.38	0.40
COUGAR	8 1/2 X 11, SUB 70, TEXT								
WHITE	0.05	0.04%	RMS	NO BID	5.92	7.55	0.00	0.30	0.38
TAG	11 x 17, SUB 100								
BRIGHT WHITE	0.20	0.16%	RMS	NO BID	NO BID	12.92	0.00	0.00	2.58
TAG	11 x 17, SUB 125								
BRIGHT WHITE	0.20	0.16%	RMS	NO BID	NO BID	15.06	0.00	0.00	3.01
CARBONLESS PRE-COLLATED REVERS	8 1/2 X 11								
2-PART	0.20	0.16%	RMS	NO BID	10.96	11.65	0.00	2.19	2.33
3-PART	0.20	0.16%	RMS	NO BID	12.04	13.14	0.00	2.41	2.63
4-PART	0.20	0.16%	RMS	NO BID	13.23	13.25	0.00	2.65	2.65
5-PART	0.10	0.08%	RMS	NO BID	13.57	13.65	0.00	1.36	1.37
CARBONLESS PRE-COLLATED STRAIG	8 1/2 X 11								
2-PART	0.20	0.16%	RMS	NO BID	NO BID	11.65	0.00	0.00	2.33
3-PART	0.20	0.16%	RMS	NO BID	12.04	13.14	0.00	2.41	2.63
4-PART	0.20	0.16%	RMS	NO BID	13.23	13.25	0.00	2.65	2.65
5-PART	0.10	0.08%	RMS	NO BID	13.57	13.65	0.00	1.36	1.37
ENVELOPES, STD FLAP, WHITE 24#									
A-2	0.01	0.01%	1,000	NO BID	35.48	28.80	0.00	0.35	0.29
A-6	0.01	0.01%	1,000	NO BID	41.00	34.85	0.00	0.41	0.35
NO. 6-1/4 REMIT	0.01	0.01%	1,000	NO BID	38.98	30.00	0.00	0.39	0.30

****Revised with lowest bids for non-bids and removed unavailable items by 2 or more vendors**

BID ONE**	BID TWO**	BID THREE**	SCORE ONE**	SCORE TWO**	SCORE TWO**
2.98	3.05	2.89	352.47	360.75	341.83
4.75	5.18	4.95	0.71	0.78	0.74
4.75	5.18	4.95	0.71	0.78	0.74
4.75	5.18	4.95	0.71	0.78	0.74
4.75	5.18	4.95	0.71	0.78	0.74
4.75	5.18	4.95	0.71	0.78	0.74
4.75	5.18	4.95	0.71	0.78	0.74
4.75	5.18	4.95	0.71	0.78	0.74
4.75	5.18	4.95	0.71	0.78	0.74
4.75	5.18	4.95	0.71	0.78	0.74
4.75	5.18	4.95	0.71	0.78	0.74
4.75	5.18	4.95	0.71	0.78	0.74
4.75	5.18	4.95	0.71	0.78	0.74
4.75	5.18	4.95	0.71	0.78	0.74
4.75	5.18	4.95	0.71	0.78	0.74
4.75	5.18	4.95	0.71	0.78	0.74
4.75	5.18	4.95	0.71	0.78	0.74
4.15	4.24	4.02	4.15	4.24	4.02
6.16	7.20	6.08	0.49	0.58	0.49
6.16	7.20	6.08	0.49	0.58	0.49
6.16	7.20	6.08	0.49	0.58	0.49
6.16	7.20	6.08	0.49	0.58	0.49
6.16	7.20	6.08	0.49	0.58	0.49
6.16	7.20	6.08	0.49	0.58	0.49
7.58	7.19	6.70	0.38	0.36	0.34
3.89	3.39	3.49	0.19	0.17	0.17
9.88	8.10	8.95	0.49	0.41	0.45
4.95	5.12	4.95	0.25	0.26	0.25
10.50	11.27	10.50	0.53	0.56	0.53
5.90	6.07	5.90	0.30	0.30	0.30
12.00	12.42	12.00	0.60	0.62	0.60
7.65	7.65	8.05	0.38	0.38	0.40
5.92	5.92	7.55	0.30	0.30	0.38
10.96	10.96	11.65	2.19	2.19	2.33
12.04	12.04	13.14	2.41	2.41	2.63
13.23	13.23	13.25	2.65	2.65	2.65
13.57	13.57	13.65	1.36	1.36	1.37
12.04	12.04	13.14	2.41	2.41	2.63
13.23	13.23	13.25	2.65	2.65	2.65
13.57	13.57	13.65	1.36	1.36	1.37
28.80	35.48	28.80	0.29	0.35	0.29
34.85	41.00	34.85	0.35	0.41	0.35
30.00	38.98	30.00	0.30	0.39	0.30

COOPERATIVE PAPER BID FOR 2020-2021
HUMBOLDT COUNTY OFFICE OF EDUCATION

ALTERNATIVE TWO LESS THAN 10,000 LBS, ONE DELIVERY PER DESTINATION

DESCRIPTION	SCORE	VALUE	UNIT	BID ONE	BID TWO	BID THREE	SCORE ONE	SCORE TWO	SCORE TWO
NO. 9 REGULAR	0.01	0.01%	1,000	NO BID	18.98	20.15	0.00	0.19	0.20
NO. 10 REGULAR	0.01	0.01%	1,000	NO BID	19.15	20.10	0.00	0.19	0.20
NO. 10 WINDOW	0.01	0.01%	1,000	NO BID	26.28	22.50	0.00	0.26	0.23
ENVELOPES, DIGITAL FLAP, WHITE WOVE 24#									
NO. 10 WINDOW	0.01	0.01%	1,000	NO BID	29.01	27.40	0.00	0.29	0.27
ASTROBRITES 8 1/2 X 11, 60# BOOK									
LIFT-OFF LEMON	0.01	0.01%	RMS	8.14	NO BID	7.50	0.08	0.00	0.08
SOLAR YELLOW	0.01	0.01%	RMS	8.14	9.49	7.50	0.08	0.09	0.08
SUNBURST YELLOW	0.01	0.01%	RMS	8.14	9.49	7.50	0.08	0.09	0.08
RE-ENTRY RED	0.01	0.01%	RMS	8.14	9.49	7.50	0.08	0.09	0.08
PLASMA PINK	0.01	0.01%	RMS	8.14	NO BID	7.50	0.08	0.00	0.08
PULSAR PINK	0.01	0.01%	RMS	8.14	9.49	7.50	0.08	0.09	0.08
FIREBALL FUCHSIA	0.01	0.01%	RMS	8.14	NO BID	7.50	0.08	0.00	0.08
BLAST-OFF BLUE	0.01	0.01%	RMS	9.95	NO BID	7.50	0.10	0.00	0.08
CELESTIAL BLUE	0.01	0.01%	RMS	8.14	NO BID	7.50	0.08	0.00	0.08
LUNAR BLUE	0.01	0.01%	RMS	8.14	9.49	7.50	0.08	0.09	0.08
TERRESTRIAL TEAL	0.01	0.01%	RMS	8.14	NO BID	7.50	0.08	0.00	0.08
ECLIPSE BLACK	0.01	0.01%	RMS	13.30	NO BID	7.50	0.13	0.00	0.08
GALAXY GOLD	0.01	0.01%	RMS	8.14	NO BID	7.50	0.08	0.00	0.08
COSMIC ORANGE	0.01	0.01%	RMS	8.14	NO BID	7.50	0.08	0.00	0.08
ORBIT ORANGE	0.01	0.01%	RMS	8.14	9.49	7.50	0.08	0.09	0.08
ROCKET RED	0.01	0.01%	RMS	8.14	NO BID	7.50	0.08	0.00	0.08
OUTRAGEOUS ORCHID	0.01	0.01%	RMS	8.14	NO BID	7.50	0.08	0.00	0.08
PLANETARY PURPLE	0.01	0.01%	RMS	8.14	9.49	7.50	0.08	0.09	0.08
GRAVITY GRAPE	0.01	0.01%	RMS	8.14	NO BID	7.50	0.08	0.00	0.08
VENUS VIOLET	0.01	0.01%	RMS	8.14	9.49	7.50	0.08	0.09	0.08
VULCAN GREEN	0.01	0.01%	RMS	8.14	9.49	7.50	0.08	0.09	0.08
TERRA GREEN	0.01	0.01%	RMS	8.14	9.49	7.50	0.08	0.09	0.08
MARTIAN GREEN	0.01	0.01%	RMS	8.14	NO BID	7.50	0.08	0.00	0.08
GAMMA GREEN	0.01	0.01%	RMS	8.14	9.49	7.50	0.08	0.09	0.08
ASTROBRITES 8 1/2 X 11, 65# COVER									
LIFT-OFF LEMON	0.01	0.01%	PKG	8.52	NO BID	6.65	0.09	0.00	0.07
SOLAR YELLOW	0.01	0.01%	PKG	8.52	9.49	6.65	0.09	0.09	0.07
SUNBURST YELLOW	0.01	0.01%	PKG	8.52	9.49	6.65	0.09	0.09	0.07
RE-ENTRY RED	0.01	0.01%	PKG	8.52	9.49	6.65	0.09	0.09	0.07
PLASMA PINK	0.01	0.01%	PKG	8.52	NO BID	6.65	0.09	0.00	0.07
PULSAR PINK	0.01	0.01%	PKG	8.52	9.49	6.65	0.09	0.09	0.07
FIREBALL FUCHSIA	0.01	0.01%	PKG	8.52	NO BID	6.65	0.09	0.00	0.07
BLAST-OFF BLUE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	10.50	NO BID	6.65	0.11	0.00	0.07
CELESTIAL BLUE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	8.52	NO BID	6.65	0.09	0.00	0.07
LUNAR BLUE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	8.52	9.49	6.65	0.09	0.09	0.07
TERRESTRIAL TEAL	0.01	0.01%	PKG	8.52	NO BID	6.65	0.09	0.00	0.07
ECLIPSE BLACK	0.01	0.01%	PKG	14.13	NO BID	NO BID	0.14	0.00	0.00
GALAXY GOLD	0.01	0.01%	PKG	8.52	NO BID	6.65	0.09	0.00	0.07
COSMIC ORANGE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	8.52	NO BID	6.65	0.09	0.00	0.07
ORBIT ORANGE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	8.52	9.49	6.65	0.09	0.09	0.07
ROCKET RED	0.01	0.01%	PKG	8.52	NO BID	6.65	0.09	0.00	0.07
OUTRAGEOUS ORCHID	0.01	0.01%	PKG	8.52	NO BID	6.65	0.09	0.00	0.07
PLANETARY PURPLE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	8.52	9.49	6.65	0.09	0.09	0.07
GRAVITY GRAPE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	8.52	NO BID	6.65	0.09	0.00	0.07
VENUS VIOLET	0.01	0.01%	PKG	8.52	NO BID	6.65	0.09	0.00	0.07
VULCAN GREEN	0.01	0.01%	PKG	8.52	9.49	6.65	0.09	0.09	0.07
TERRA GREEN	0.01	0.01%	PKG	8.52	9.49	6.65	0.09	0.09	0.07
MARTIAN GREEN	0.01	0.01%	PKG	8.52	NO BID	6.65	0.09	0.00	0.07
GAMMA GREEN	0.01	0.01%	PKG	8.52	9.49	6.65	0.09	0.09	0.07
ASTROBRITES 11 X 17, 65# COVER									
LIFT-OFF LEMON	0.01	0.01%	PKG	17.30	NO BID	14.36	0.17	0.00	0.14
SOLAR YELLOW	0.01	0.01%	PKG	17.30	NO BID	14.36	0.17	0.00	0.14
SUNBURST YELLOW	0.01	0.01%	PKG	17.30	NO BID	14.36	0.17	0.00	0.14
RE-ENTRY RED	0.01	0.01%	PKG	17.30	NO BID	14.36	0.17	0.00	0.14
PULSAR PINK	0.01	0.01%	PKG	17.30	NO BID	14.36	0.17	0.00	0.14
FIREBALL FUCHSIA	0.01	0.01%	PKG	17.30	NO BID	14.36	0.17	0.00	0.14
CELESTIAL BLUE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	17.30	NO BID	14.36	0.17	0.00	0.14

****Revised with lowest bids for non-bids and removed unavailable items by 2 or more vendors**

BID ONE**	BID TWO**	BID THREE**	SCORE ONE**	SCORE TWO**	SCORE TWO**
18.98	18.98	20.15	0.19	0.19	0.20
19.15	19.15	20.10	0.19	0.19	0.20
22.50	26.28	22.50	0.23	0.26	0.23

27.40	29.01	27.40	0.27	0.29	0.27
-------	-------	-------	------	------	------

8.14	6.65	7.50	0.08	0.07	0.08
8.14	9.49	7.50	0.08	0.09	0.08
8.14	9.49	7.50	0.08	0.09	0.08
8.14	9.49	7.50	0.08	0.09	0.08
8.14	6.65	7.50	0.08	0.07	0.08
8.14	9.49	7.50	0.08	0.09	0.08
8.14	6.65	7.50	0.08	0.07	0.08
8.14	9.49	7.50	0.08	0.09	0.08
8.14	6.65	7.50	0.10	0.07	0.08
8.14	6.65	7.50	0.08	0.07	0.08
8.14	9.49	7.50	0.08	0.09	0.08
8.14	6.65	7.50	0.08	0.07	0.08
13.30	6.65	7.50	0.13	0.07	0.08
8.14	6.65	7.50	0.08	0.07	0.08
8.14	6.65	7.50	0.08	0.07	0.08
8.14	9.49	7.50	0.08	0.09	0.08
8.14	6.65	7.50	0.08	0.07	0.08
8.14	9.49	7.50	0.08	0.09	0.08
8.14	6.65	7.50	0.08	0.07	0.08
8.14	9.49	7.50	0.08	0.09	0.08
8.14	9.49	7.50	0.08	0.09	0.08
8.14	6.65	7.50	0.08	0.07	0.08
8.14	9.49	7.50	0.08	0.09	0.08

8.52	6.65	6.65	0.09	0.07	0.07
8.52	9.49	6.65	0.09	0.09	0.07
8.52	9.49	6.65	0.09	0.09	0.07
8.52	9.49	6.65	0.09	0.09	0.07
8.52	6.65	6.65	0.09	0.07	0.07
8.52	9.49	6.65	0.09	0.09	0.07
8.52	6.65	6.65	0.09	0.07	0.07
10.50	6.65	6.65	0.11	0.07	0.07
8.52	6.65	6.65	0.09	0.07	0.07
8.52	9.49	6.65	0.09	0.09	0.07
8.52	6.65	6.65	0.09	0.07	0.07
8.52	9.49	6.65	0.09	0.09	0.07
8.52	6.65	6.65	0.09	0.07	0.07
8.52	9.49	6.65	0.09	0.09	0.07
8.52	6.65	6.65	0.09	0.07	0.07
8.52	9.49	6.65	0.09	0.09	0.07
8.52	6.65	6.65	0.09	0.07	0.07
8.52	9.49	6.65	0.09	0.09	0.07

17.30	14.36	14.36	0.17	0.14	0.14
17.30	14.36	14.36	0.17	0.14	0.14
17.30	14.36	14.36	0.17	0.14	0.14
17.30	14.36	14.36	0.17	0.14	0.14
17.30	14.36	14.36	0.17	0.14	0.14
17.30	14.36	14.36	0.17	0.14	0.14
17.30	14.36	14.36	0.17	0.14	0.14

**COOPERATIVE PAPER BID FOR 2020-2021
HUMBOLDT COUNTY OFFICE OF EDUCATION**

ALTERNATIVE TWO LESS THAN 10,000 LBS, ONE DELIVERY PER DESTINATION

DESCRIPTION	SCORE	VALUE	UNIT	BID ONE	BID TWO	BID THREE	SCORE ONE	SCORE TWO	SCORE TWO
LUNAR BLUE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	17.30	NO BID	14.36	0.17	0.00	0.14
ECLIPSE BLACK	0.01	0.01%	PKG	28.75	NO BID	NO BID	0.29	0.00	0.00
GALAXY GOLD	0.01	0.01%	PKG	17.30	NO BID	14.36	0.17	0.00	0.14
COSMIC ORANGE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	17.30	NO BID	14.36	0.17	0.00	0.14
ORBIT ORANGE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	17.30	NO BID	14.36	0.17	0.00	0.14
ROCKET RED	0.01	0.01%	PKG	17.30	NO BID	14.36	0.17	0.00	0.14
PLANETARY PURPLE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	17.30	NO BID	14.36	0.17	0.00	0.14
VULCAN GREEN	0.01	0.01%	PKG	17.30	NO BID	14.36	0.17	0.00	0.14
TERRA GREEN	0.01	0.01%	PKG	17.30	NO BID	14.36	0.17	0.00	0.14
MARTIAN GREEN	0.01	0.01%	PKG	17.30	NO BID	14.36	0.17	0.00	0.14
GAMMA GREEN	0.01	0.01%	PKG	17.30	NO BID	14.36	0.17	0.00	0.14
INDEX, SUB 90	8 1/2 X 11 250 SHEETS PER PKG								
WHITE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	6.77	6.01	5.75	0.07	0.06	0.06
INDEX, SUB 90	11 X 17, 250 SHEETS PER PKG								
WHITE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	14.20	12.58	11.45	0.14	0.13	0.11
INDEX, SUB 90	12 X 18 250 SHEETS PER PKG								
WHITE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	NO BID	NO BID	15.00	0.00	0.00	0.15
INDEX, SUB 90	13X19 250 SHEETS PER PKG								
WHITE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	NO BID	NO BID	22.50	0.00	0.00	0.23

24# PREMIUM MATTE INKJET ROLL PAPER

24" X 150' 2" OR 3" CORE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	NO BID	NO BID	80.80	0.00	0.00	0.81
--------------------------	------	-------	-----	--------	--------	-------	------	------	------

PREMIUM MATTE PHOTO ROLL PAPER

24" X 100' 3" CORE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	NO BID	NO BID	39.48	0.00	0.00	0.39
--------------------	------	-------	-----	--------	--------	-------	------	------	------

ECONOMY MATTE IMAGING ROLL PAPER

24" X 100' 3" CORE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	NO BID	NO BID	39.48	0.00	0.00	0.39
--------------------	------	-------	-----	--------	--------	-------	------	------	------

Other Scoring Metrics - Yes=0 or No=1

Rush Shipping/Delivery Available?	0.50	0.39%	N/A	1.00	1.00	0.00	0.50	0.50	0.00
Bid Prices Continue through 06/30/2020?	0.50	0.39%	N/A	1.00	1.00	0.00	0.50	0.50	0.00
Weekly delivery a-la-carte at bid price?	0.50	0.39%	N/A	1.00	1.00	0.00	0.50	0.50	0.00
Option for bulk printing of envelopes	0.50	0.39%	N/A	1.00	0.00	0.00	0.50	0.00	0.00

TOTAL	127.00	100.00%	127.00				Initial Score	379.49	402.69	396.58
							Initial Items Bid	96.00	70.00	121.00
							Initial % Items Bid	76%	55%	95%

****Revised weith lowest bids for non-bids and removed unavailable items by 2 or more vendors**

BID ONE**	BID TWO**	BID THREE**	SCORE ONE**	SCORE TWO**	SCORE TWO**
17.30	14.36	14.36	0.17	0.14	0.14
17.30	14.36	14.36	0.17	0.14	0.14
17.30	14.36	14.36	0.17	0.14	0.14
17.30	14.36	14.36	0.17	0.14	0.14
17.30	14.36	14.36	0.17	0.14	0.14
17.30	14.36	14.36	0.17	0.14	0.14
17.30	14.36	14.36	0.17	0.14	0.14
17.30	14.36	14.36	0.17	0.14	0.14
17.30	14.36	14.36	0.17	0.14	0.14
17.30	14.36	14.36	0.17	0.14	0.14
17.30	14.36	14.36	0.17	0.14	0.14
17.30	14.36	14.36	0.17	0.14	0.14
17.30	14.36	14.36	0.17	0.14	0.14
17.30	14.36	14.36	0.17	0.14	0.14
17.30	14.36	14.36	0.17	0.14	0.14

6.77	6.01	5.75	0.07	0.06	0.06
------	------	------	------	------	------

14.20	12.58	11.45	0.14	0.13	0.11
-------	-------	-------	------	------	------

--	--	--	--	--	--

--	--	--	--	--	--

--	--	--	--	--	--

--	--	--	--	--	--

--	--	--	--	--	--

1.00	1.00	0.00	0.50	0.50	0.00
------	------	------	------	------	------

1.00	1.00	0.00	0.50	0.50	0.00
------	------	------	------	------	------

1.00	1.00	0.00	0.50	0.50	0.00
------	------	------	------	------	------

1.00	0.00	0.00	0.50	0.00	0.00
------	------	------	------	------	------

		Final Score	398.24	406.86	385.22
114.00		Total Items	114.00	114.00	114.00
		% of Bid Completed	100%	100%	100%

NOTES
 Bid One = Contract Paper Group Second lowest score, but did not bid on 90% of the items and is disqualified
 Bid Two = Mendes Supply Company Highest score and did not bid on 90% of the items and is disqualified
 Bid Three = West Coast Paper Company Lowest score and bid on 90% of listed items

**COOPERATIVE PAPER BID FOR 2020-2021
HUMBOLDT COUNTY OFFICE OF EDUCATION**

ALTERNATIVE THREE

WAREHOUSING

DESCRIPTION	VALUE	SCORE	UNIT	BID ONE	SCORE ONE
XEROGRAPHIC, SULPHITE 8 1/2 X 11, SUB 20					
WHITE	155.95	92.28%	RMS	3.42	533.35
YELLOW	0.18	0.11%	RMS	5.45	0.98
BLUE	0.18	0.11%	RMS	5.45	0.98
GREEN	0.18	0.11%	RMS	5.45	0.98
PINK	0.18	0.11%	RMS	5.45	0.98
GOLD	0.18	0.11%	RMS	5.45	0.98
BUFF	0.18	0.11%	RMS	5.45	0.98
SALMON	0.18	0.11%	RMS	5.45	0.98
CHERRY	0.18	0.11%	RMS	5.45	0.98
TAN	0.18	0.11%	RMS	5.45	0.98
IVORY	0.18	0.11%	RMS	5.45	0.98
GRAY	0.18	0.11%	RMS	5.45	0.98
CREAM WHITE	0.18	0.11%	RMS	5.45	0.98
ORCHID	0.18	0.11%	RMS	5.45	0.98

XEROGRAPHIC

8 1/2 X 11, SUB 60

WHITE	0.10	0.06%	RMS	5.68	0.57
-------	------	-------	-----	------	------

XEROGRAPHIC

8 1/2 X 14, SUB 20

WHITE	0.10	0.06%	RMS	4.75	0.48
SALMON	0.10	0.06%	RMS	7.20	0.72
IVORY	0.10	0.06%	RMS	7.20	0.72
BUFF	0.10	0.06%	RMS	7.20	0.72
GREEN	0.10	0.06%	RMS	7.20	0.72
GOLD	0.10	0.06%	RMS	7.20	0.72
BLUE	0.10	0.06%	RMS	7.20	0.72
PINK	0.10	0.06%	RMS	7.20	0.72
YELLOW	0.10	0.06%	RMS	7.20	0.72
GREY	0.10	0.06%	RMS	7.20	0.72
ORCHID	0.10	0.06%	RMS	7.20	0.72
TAN	0.10	0.06%	RMS	7.20	0.72

XEROGRAPHIC

11 X 17, SUB 20

WHITE	0.10	0.06%	RMS	8.30	0.83
-------	------	-------	-----	------	------

XEROGRAPHIC

11 X 17, SUB 60

WHITE	0.10	0.06%	RMS	11.55	1.16
-------	------	-------	-----	-------	------

XEROGRAPHIC

11 X 17, SUB 70

WHITE	0.10	0.06%	RMS	13.45	1.35
-------	------	-------	-----	-------	------

ENVELOPES, STD FLAP, WHITE SUB 24

A-2	0.01	0.01%	1000	30.85	0.31
A-6	0.01	0.01%	1000	36.00	0.36
NO. 6-1/4 REMIT	0.01	0.01%	1000	29.95	0.30
NO. 6-3/4 REGULAR	0.01	0.01%	1000	23.50	0.24
NO. 6-3/4 WINDOW	0.01	0.01%	1000	27.00	0.27
NO. 9 REGULAR	0.01	0.01%	1000	24.10	0.24

**COOPERATIVE PAPER BID FOR 2020-2021
HUMBOLDT COUNTY OFFICE OF EDUCATION**

ALTERNATIVE THREE

WAREHOUSING

DESCRIPTION	VALUE	SCORE	UNIT	BID ONE	SCORE ONE
NO. 10 WINDOW	0.01	0.01%	1000	26.95	0.27
NO. 10 REGULAR	0.01	0.01%	1000	24.10	0.24

ENVELOPES, DIGITAL FLAP, WHITE WOVE 24#

NO. 10 WINDOW	0.01	0.01%	1,000	30.50	0.31
---------------	------	-------	-------	-------	------

ASTROBRITES

8 1/2 X 11, 60# BOOK

LIFT-OFF LEMON	0.05	0.03%	RMS	8.50	0.43
SOLAR YELLOW	0.05	0.03%	RMS	8.50	0.43
SUNBURST YELLOW	0.05	0.03%	RMS	8.50	0.43
RE-ENTRY RED	0.05	0.03%	RMS	8.50	0.43
PLASMA PINK	0.05	0.03%	RMS	8.50	0.43
PULSAR PINK	0.05	0.03%	RMS	8.50	0.43
FIREBALL FUCHSIA	0.05	0.03%	RMS	8.50	0.43
BLAST-OFF BLUE	0.05	0.03%	RMS	8.50	0.43
CELESTIAL BLUE	0.05	0.03%	RMS	8.50	0.43
LUNAR BLUE	0.05	0.03%	RMS	8.50	0.43
TERRESTRIAL TEAL	0.05	0.03%	RMS	8.50	0.43
ECLIPSE BLACK	0.05	0.03%	RMS	8.50	0.43
GALAXY GOLD	0.05	0.03%	RMS	8.50	0.43
COSMIC ORANGE	0.05	0.03%	RMS	8.50	0.43
ORBIT ORANGE	0.05	0.03%	RMS	8.50	0.43
ROCKET RED	0.05	0.03%	RMS	8.50	0.43
OUTRAGEOUS ORCHID	0.05	0.03%	RMS	8.50	0.43
PLANETARY PURPLE	0.05	0.03%	RMS	8.50	0.43
GRAVITY GRAPE	0.05	0.03%	RMS	8.50	0.43
VENUS VIOLET	0.05	0.03%	RMS	8.50	0.43
VULCAN GREEN	0.05	0.03%	RMS	8.50	0.43
TERRA GREEN	0.05	0.03%	RMS	8.50	0.43
MARTIAN GREEN	0.05	0.03%	RMS	8.50	0.43
GAMMA GREEN	0.05	0.03%	RMS	8.50	0.43

ASTROBRITES

8 1/2 X 11, 65# COVER

LIFT-OFF LEMON	0.01	0.01%	PKG	8.40	0.08
SOLAR YELLOW	0.01	0.01%	PKG	8.40	0.08
SUNBURST YELLOW	0.01	0.01%	PKG	8.40	0.08
RE-ENTRY RED	0.01	0.01%	PKG	8.40	0.08
PLASMA PINK	0.01	0.01%	PKG	8.40	0.08
PULSAR PINK	0.01	0.01%	PKG	8.40	0.08
FIREBALL FUCHSIA	0.01	0.01%	PKG	8.40	0.08
BLAST-OFF BLUE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	8.40	0.08
CELESTIAL BLUE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	8.40	0.08
LUNAR BLUE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	8.40	0.08
TERRESTRIAL TEAL	0.01	0.01%	PKG	8.40	0.08
ECLIPSE BLACK	0.01	0.01%	PKG	NO BID	
GALAXY GOLD	0.01	0.01%	PKG	8.40	0.08
COSMIC ORANGE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	8.40	0.08
ORBIT ORANGE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	8.40	0.08
ROCKET RED	0.01	0.01%	PKG	8.40	0.08
OUTRAGEOUS ORCHID	0.01	0.01%	PKG	8.40	0.08
PLANETARY PURPLE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	8.40	0.08

**COOPERATIVE PAPER BID FOR 2020-2021
HUMBOLDT COUNTY OFFICE OF EDUCATION**

ALTERNATIVE THREE

WAREHOUSING

DESCRIPTION	VALUE	SCORE	UNIT	BID ONE	SCORE ONE
GRAVITY GRAPE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	8.40	0.08
VENUS VIOLET	0.01	0.01%	PKG	8.40	0.08
VULCAN GREEN	0.01	0.01%	PKG	8.40	0.08
TERRA GREEN	0.01	0.01%	PKG	8.40	0.08
MARTIAN GREEN	0.01	0.01%	PKG	8.40	0.08
GAMMA GREEN	0.01	0.01%	PKG	8.40	0.08

ASTROBRITES

11x17, 65# COVER

LIFT-OFF LEMON	0.01	0.01%	PKG	18.15	0.18
SOLAR YELLOW	0.01	0.01%	PKG	18.15	0.18
SUNBURST YELLOW	0.01	0.01%	PKG	18.15	0.18
RE-ENTRY RED	0.01	0.01%	PKG	18.15	0.18
PULSAR PINK	0.01	0.01%	PKG	18.15	0.18
FIREBALL FUCHSIA	0.01	0.01%	PKG	18.15	0.18
CELESTIAL BLUE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	18.15	0.18
LUNAR BLUE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	18.15	0.18
ECLIPSE BLACK	0.01	0.01%	PKG	NO BID	
GALAXY GOLD	0.01	0.01%	PKG	18.15	0.18
COSMIC ORANGE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	18.15	0.18
ORBIT ORANGE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	18.15	0.18
ROCKET RED	0.01	0.01%	PKG	18.15	0.18
PLANETARY PURPLE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	18.15	0.18
VULCAN GREEN	0.01	0.01%	PKG	18.15	0.18
TERRA GREEN	0.01	0.01%	PKG	18.15	0.18
MARTIAN GREEN	0.01	0.01%	PKG	18.15	0.18
GAMMA GREEN	0.01	0.01%	PKG	18.15	0.18

INDEX, SUB 90

8 1/2 X 11, 250 SHEETS PER PKG

WHITE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	6.40	0.06
YELLOW	0.01	0.01%	PKG	6.75	0.07
BLUE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	6.75	0.07
GREEN	0.01	0.01%	PKG	6.75	0.07
BUFF	0.01	0.01%	PKG	6.75	0.07
SALMON	0.01	0.01%	PKG	6.75	0.07
CHERRY	0.01	0.01%	PKG	6.75	0.07
IVORY	0.01	0.01%	PKG	6.75	0.07
GRAY	0.01	0.01%	PKG	6.75	0.07

INDEX, SUB 90

11 X 17, 250 SHEETS PER PKG

WHITE	0.02	0.01%	PKG	13.40	0.27
-------	------	-------	-----	-------	------

WAUSAU BRIGHT WHITE 80# COVER 11 X 17, 250 SHEETS PER PKG

WHITE	0.02	0.01%	PKG	20.10	0.40
-------	------	-------	-----	-------	------

TAG, SUB100

11 X 17, 250 SHEETS PER PKG

BRIGHT WHITE	0.10	0.06%	PKG	15.12	1.51
--------------	------	-------	-----	-------	------

**COOPERATIVE PAPER BID FOR 2020-2021
HUMBOLDT COUNTY OFFICE OF EDUCATION**

ALTERNATIVE THREE

WAREHOUSING

DESCRIPTION	VALUE	SCORE	UNIT	BID ONE	SCORE ONE
CARBONLESS PRE-COLLATED REVERSE SEQUENCE				8 1/2 X 11	
2-PART	0.15	0.09%	RMS	14.00	2.10
3-PART	0.15	0.09%	RMS	15.80	2.37
4-PART	0.15	0.09%	RMS	16.10	2.42
5-PART	0.06	0.04%	RMS	16.45	0.99

CARBONLESS PRE-COLLATED, REVERSE SEQUENCE

8 1/2 X 14

4-PART	0.10	0.06%	RMS	21.00	2.10
--------	------	-------	-----	-------	------

CARBONLESS PRE-COLLATED, REVERSE SEQUENCE

11 X 17

2-PART	0.15	0.09%	RMS	27.50	4.13
3-PART	0.15	0.09%	RMS	31.00	4.65
4-PART	0.06	0.04%	RMS	33.20	1.99

CARBONLESS PRE-COLLATED STRAIGHT SEQUENCE

8 1/2 X 11

2-PART	0.15	0.09%	RMS	14.00	2.10
3-PART	0.15	0.09%	RMS	15.80	2.37
4-PART	0.15	0.09%	RMS	16.10	2.42
5-PART	0.06	0.04%	RMS	16.45	0.99

CARBONLESS PRE-COLLATED STRAIGHT SEQUENCE

8 1/2 X 14

4-PART	0.10	0.06%	RMS	21.00	2.10
--------	------	-------	-----	-------	------

CARBONLESS PRE-COLLATED STRAIGHT SEQUENCE

11 X 17

2-PART	0.15	0.09%	RMS	27.50	4.13
3-PART	0.15	0.09%	RMS	31.00	4.65
4-PART	0.06	0.04%	RMS	33.20	1.99

NCR TAGBOARD

CF 11 X 17

WHITE	0.15	0.09%	RMS	58.00	8.70
-------	------	-------	-----	-------	------

OPAQUE TEXT

11 X 17 SUB 70

WHITE	0.02	0.01%	RMS	14.00	0.28
-------	------	-------	-----	-------	------

OPAQUE TEXT

11 X 17 SUB 100

WHITE	0.01	0.01%	RMS	13.00	0.13
-------	------	-------	-----	-------	------

FOX RIVER CIRCA 83

8 1/2 X 11 SUB 24

ARCTIC WHITE	0.01	0.01%	RMS	17.20	0.17
--------------	------	-------	-----	-------	------

COUGAR DIGITAL COVER

8 1/2 X 11 SUB 80

WHITE	0.02	0.01%	PKG	9.65	0.19
-------	------	-------	-----	------	------

COUGAR DIGITAL TEXT

8 1/2 X 11 SUB 70

WHITE	0.02	0.01%	RMS	8.75	0.18
-------	------	-------	-----	------	------

**COOPERATIVE PAPER BID FOR 2020-2021
HUMBOLDT COUNTY OFFICE OF EDUCATION**

ALTERNATIVE THREE

WAREHOUSING

DESCRIPTION	VALUE	SCORE	UNIT	BID ONE	SCORE ONE
DIGITAL COATED - DULL COVER, SUB 80			12 x 18, 800 SHEETS PER CARTON		
WHITE	0.01	0.01%	CARTON	27.22	0.27
DIGITAL COATED - DULL COVER, SUB 100			12 x 18, 700 SHEETS PER CARTON		
WHITE	0.01	0.01%	CARTON	33.95	0.34
DIGITAL COATED - GLOSS COVER, SUB 80			12 x 18, 800 SHEETS PER CARTON		
WHITE	0.01	0.01%	CARTON	27.10	0.27
DIGITAL COATED - GLOSS COVER, SUB 100			12 x 18, 700 SHEETS PER CARTON		
WHITE	0.01	0.01%	CARTON	34.16	0.34
DIGITAL COATED - DULL COVER, SUB 80			11 x 17, 750 SHEETS PER CARTON		
WHITE	0.01	0.01%	CARTON	24.70	0.25
DIGITAL COATED - DULL COVER, SUB 100			11 x 17, 750 SHEETS PER CARTON		
WHITE	0.01	0.01%	CARTON	29.50	0.30
DIGITAL COATED - GLOSS COVER, SUB 80			11 x 17, 750 SHEETS PER CARTON		
WHITE	0.01	0.01%	CARTON	23.90	0.24
DIGITAL COATED - GLOSS COVER, SUB 100			11 x 17, 750 SHEETS PER CARTON		
WHITE	0.01	0.01%	CARTON	30.70	0.31
DIGITAL COATED - GLOSS TEXT SUB 80			11 x 17, 1000 SHEETS PER PKG		
WHITE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	36.75	0.37
DIGITAL COATED - GLOSS TEXT SUB 80			8 1/2 x 11, 1000 SHEETS PER PKG		
WHITE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	18.60	0.19
DIGITAL COATED - GLOSS TEXT SUB 100			8 1/2 x 11, 1000 SHEETS PER PKG		
WHITE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	11.64	0.12
DIGITAL COATED - GLOSS TEXT SUB 100			11X14, 1000 SHEETS PER PKG		
WHITE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	NO BID	
DIGITAL COATED - GLOSS TEXT SUB 100			12X18, 1000 SHEETS PER PKG		
WHITE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	35.60	0.36
DIGITAL COATED - DULL COVER, SUB 80			12 x 18, 500 SHEETS PER CARTON		
WHITE	0.01	0.01%	CARTON	27.20	0.27
DIGITAL COATED - DULL COVER, SUB 100			12 x 18, 500 SHEETS PER CARTON		
WHITE	0.01	0.01%	CARTON	33.95	0.34
DIGITAL COATED - GLOSS COVER, SUB 80			12 x 18, 500 SHEETS PER CARTON		
WHITE	0.01	0.01%	CARTON	27.05	0.27
DIGITAL COATED - GLOSS COVER, SUB 100			12 x 18, 500 SHEETS PER CARTON		
WHITE	0.01	0.01%	CARTON	34.10	0.34

**COOPERATIVE PAPER BID FOR 2020-2021
HUMBOLDT COUNTY OFFICE OF EDUCATION**

ALTERNATIVE THREE

WAREHOUSING

DESCRIPTION	VALUE	SCORE	UNIT	BID ONE	SCORE ONE
DIGITAL COATED - DULL COVER, SUB 80				11 x 17, 500 SHEETS PER CARTON	
WHITE	0.01	0.01%	CARTON	24.70	0.25

DIGITAL COATED - DULL COVER, SUB 100				11 x 17, 500 SHEETS PER CARTON	
WHITE	0.01	0.01%	CARTON	29.60	0.30

DIGITAL COATED - GLOSS COVER, SUB 80				11 x 17, 500 SHEETS PER CARTON	
WHITE	0.01	0.01%	CARTON	23.90	0.24

DIGITAL COATED - GLOSS COVER, SUB 100				11 x 17, 500 SHEETS PER CARTON	
WHITE	0.01	0.01%	CARTON	30.70	0.31

DIGITAL COATED - GLOSS TEXT SUB 80				11 x 17, 1000 SHEETS PER PKG	
WHITE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	36.75	0.37

24# PREMIUM MATTE INKJET ROLL PAPER					
24" X 150' 2" OR 3" CORE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	91.50	0.92

PREMIUM MATTE PHOTO ROLL PAPER					
24" X 100' 3" CORE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	44.95	0.45

ECONOMY MATTE IMAGING ROLL PAPER					
24" X 100' 3" CORE	0.01	0.01%	PKG	49.95	0.50

Other Scoring Metrics - Yes=0 or No=1					
Rush Shipping/Delivery Available?	1.00	0.59%	N/A	0.00	0.00
Bid Prices Continue through 06/30/2020?	1.25	0.74%	N/A	0.00	0.00
Weekly delivery a-la-carte at bid price?	1.25	0.74%	N/A	0.00	0.00
Option for bulk printing of envelopes	1.25	0.74%	N/A	0.00	0.00

TOTAL	169.00	100.00%	169.00	Initial Score	637.94
				Initial Items Bid	161.00
				Initial % Items Bid	95%

NOTES

Bid One: West Coast Paper Solutions Received only 1 qualifying bid for Alternative 3